D. Loren Washburn (#10993) lwashburn@smithwashburn.com

SMITH WASHBURN, LLP

8 East Broadway, Suite 320 Salt Lake City, UT 84111 Telephone: (801) 584-1800 Facsimile: (801) 584-1820

Attorneys for Charles D. Scoville

IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT DISTRICT OF UTAH, CENTRAL DIVISION

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE COMMISSION,

Plaintiff,

v.

TRAFFIC MONSOON, LLC, et al.,

Defendants.

MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES

Case No. 2:16-cv-00832-JNP

INTRODUCTION

Charles Scoville hereby moves the Court for an order directing the Receiver to pay attorney fees he incurred in appealing this Court's order from the assets of the Receivership Estate. Due to the difficulties Mr. Scoville has experienced, as previously documented in various filings including his Motion to Excuse Appearance of Defendant Charles Scoville at Upcoming Evidentiary Hearing and Motion to Excuse Compliance with Subpoena, he has been unable to work to raise funds to pay his own attorneys' fees. Meanwhile, as the Court recognized during oral argument and in its written order granting the SEC's request for a preliminary injunction, the issues that Mr. Scoville has been litigating are important matters of first impression to the securities industry and to the Securities and Exchange Commission, which is charged with enforcing the statutes at issue in the Court's Memorandum Decision and Order Granting a Preliminary Junction and Denying Defendants' Motion to Set Aside the Receivership (Dkt. 79). The fees Mr. Scoville requests are

MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES CASE No. 2:16-CV-00832-JNP, PAGE 1

¹ See Dkt. No. 138 (discussing Mr. Scoville's health-related issues).

entirely related to issues concerning the SEC's extraterritorial enforcement of the securities laws of the United States under *Morrison v. Nat'l Australia Bank Ltd.*, 561 U.S. 247 (2010).

APPLICABLE LAW

A number of Courts, including the District of Utah, have found that a court has the discretion to order that receivership assets be used to pay attorneys' fees, especially early in a case when issues related to the SEC's case are unsettled. *See e.g.*, *S.E.C. v. Curtis DeYoung*, 2:14-cv-00309-RJS-DBP Dkt. Nos. 217, 147, 173 (granting fees of \$157,559.44 paid from receivership funds for litigant preparing for and participating in preliminary injunction hearing); *see also S.E.C. v. Duclaud Gonzalez de Castilla*, 170 F.Supp.2d 427, 430 (S.D.N.Y. 2001); *S.E.C. v. Dowdell*, 175 F.Supp.2d 850, 855–56 (W.D.Va. 2001). Because the creation of a receivership is an exercise of a court's equitable discretion, the court maintains discretion to modify its order and to direct the receiver to release funds to a defendant where it is equitable and appropriate to do so.

The *DeYoung* case is an illustrative example of this principle from this District. In that case, the defendant operated a business investing retirements funds. The SEC alleged that poor investment decisions and outright fraud resulted in a shortfall of \$24 million in the company's accounts. Nonetheless, the defendant sought and received payment of more than \$150,000 in attorney fees from the receivership estate which he used to litigate the case through the preliminary injunction stage. Later in the case, the court denied subsequent motions for attorney fees because the Court found that case-determinative factual and legal issues had become settled and no longer justified payment of attorney fees.

ARGUMENT

I. THE COURT SHOULD ORDER FEES TO COMPENSATE MR. SCOVILLE'S ATTORNEYS FOR APPEALING THE ISSUES THAT THE COURT RECOGNIZED WERE UNSETTLED AND NECESSARY TO REVIEW.

In this case, the Court should order that fees incurred to appeal the Court's order granting the SEC's motion for a preliminary injunction (Dkt. 79) should be paid from Receivership funds.

MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES CASE No. 2:16-CV-00832-JNP, PAGE 2

The reasons that such an order would be an equitable and just are as follows: (1) the *Morrison* issue—which was at the center of Defendants' opposition to the SEC's preliminary injunction motion and the centerpiece of his appeal—is a completely unsettled matter in the law, as there are no district-level or appeals-level decisions giving direction to citizens, regulators, or courts; (2) the issues Defendants are litigating are determinative of the majority of the issues in the case and a victory would result in the release of approximately 75% of the funds in the Receivership; and (3) Mr. Scoville's health problems have precluded him from raising funds for his own support, much less to fund a sophisticated opposition and appeal.

To date, Mr. Scoville has incurred hundreds of thousands of dollars to fund his litigation. A large portion of those fees have been paid by family members and supporters. However, the attorneys who were primarily responsible for preparing the appellate briefs have accrued unpaid fees of more than \$150,000.² Mr. Scoville has no ability to pay these fees. If the Court does not order payment of these attorney fees, his attorneys likely will never be paid for litigating the *Morrison* issue that was previously undecided.

The litigation in this case surrounding the *Morrison* issue was not frivolous and was necessary to settle a previously undecided issue. As the Court noted multiple times during argument³ and in its written order, whether the Dodd-Frank *Morrison* "fix" in fact overruled the Supreme Court's decision in *Morrison* as to the SEC's ability to enforce the anti-fraud securities laws in transactions taking place outside the United States was undecided before this Court's decision.⁴ The Court recognized that further litigation would be beneficial and that payment of attorney fees would be necessary to accomplish that review.⁵ The Court recognized that the

² See Exhibit A, invoices from Marquis Aurbach Coffing for preparing briefs in Appeal.

³ Tr. of Oral Argument on the Motion for a Preliminary Injunction and Motion to Set Aside the Receivership dated November 30, 2016 ("Nov. 30th Tr."), at 112:2–3 ("I think there's no controlling authority with respect to many of these issues.").

⁴ Dkt. 79 at p. 44 ("Although several district courts have noted the possibility that Section 929P9(b) may have superseded the *Morrison* test, none have actually decided the question.").

⁵ See Nov. 30th Tr. at 113:17–21 ("But I'm also cognizant of the fact that we can't get a meaningful discussion of the legal issues if the order that's in place prohibits the defendants from having enough assets to pay an attorney.")

decision it had made was unsettled and warranted immediate review when it certified its decision for immediate appeal. (Dkt. 79, § IV).

Not only were the *Morrison*-related issues undecided, they were key to the resolution of most of the claims at issue in this case. As noted in the SEC's original pleadings and motion for preliminary injunction, more than 90% of the customers of Traffic Monsoon were outside of the United States. Even if all the claims of the "investors" in Traffic Monsoon within the United States were held in the Receivership Estate, at least 45 million dollars would be released from the Receivership Estate. Thus, this single issue surrounding *Morrison* would have had a dramatic effect on the funds in the Receivership and would change the need for and duties of the Receiver.

Finally, as the Court is now aware, Mr. Scoville has had numerous issues making it difficult, if not impossible, for him to work to raise funds to defend against this case. Specifically, given the health issues previously documented, and his multiple hospitalizations, Mr. Scoville was unable to be employed for most of the past year. Then, approximately one month ago, Mr. Scoville was arrested on unrelated charges brought by the State of Utah. As a result, he is unable to earn funds to pay his attorney fees. Because of these recent developments the plans that had existed to eventually pay Mr. Scoville's fees have had to change and it is likely the attorneys who prepared the appeal will never be paid without an order from this Court.

II. THE REQUESTED FEES ARE REASONABLE.

The fees sought by Mr. Scoville's counsel are not only necessary, they are reasonable. Attached to this motion as Exhibit A are redacted invoices from Mr. Scoville's appellate counsel. The total of incurred but unpaid fees and expenses is \$171,861.61. Those fees included review of the District Court record, consultation with co-counsel, extensive research, consultation with Mr. Scoville on matters to be raised, replying to the SEC's brief, preparing for oral argument (including mooting the argument), attending oral argument, and the costs incurred in assembling and serving briefs and in travelling to and attending the oral argument. As the Court will recognize in reviewing these briefs, the appeal required hundreds of hours of work, took substantial effort, and required a

MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES CASE No. 2:16-CV-00832-JNP, PAGE 4

Case 2:16-cv-00832-JNP Document 158 Filed 07/23/18 Page 5 of 6

sophisticated and nuanced approach to research and presentation of unsettled legal issues. In short,

sophisticated appellate counsel was required.

Mr. Scoville's chosen counsel was reasonable. Attached as Exhibit B is Mr. Scoville's

chosen counsel's curriculum vitae. Mr. Echols is an experienced attorney who focuses entirely on

appellate practice. He has more than a decade of first-chair appellate experience in briefing and

arguing issues to courts of appeals. His expertise was crucial to the competent presentation of the

issues in this case.

To the extent the Court believes that further briefing on the reasonableness of fees is

necessary, Mr. Scoville is prepared to present expert testimony from a local attorney who will

opine that the amount of time spent on this matter was reasonable, that the hourly rate charged is

reasonable, and that the services for which Mr. Scoville's counsel billed were necessary to this

litigation.

CONCLUSION

Because this litigation is based on a previously undecided dispositive issue, which the

Court recognized was unsettled and needed to be fully litigated, and because Mr. Scoville has been

unable to fund his defense, the Court should order that his fees be paid from the Receivership

Estate.

The fees incurred to date related to the appeal from the Court's order granting the SEC's

preliminary injunction, totaling \$171,861.61, have been reasonable.

DATED: July 23, 2018

SMITH WASHBURN, LLP

/s/ D. Loren Washburn

D. Loren Washburn

Attorneys for Defendants

MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES CASE NO. 2:16-CV-00832-JNP, PAGE 5

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that on July 23, 2018, the foregoing **MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES** was served on the person(s) named below via CM/ECF:

Daniel J. Wadley Amy J. Oliver Alison J. Okinaka Cheryl M. Mori SECURITIES EXCHANGE COMMISSION 351 South West Temple, Suite 6.100 Salt Lake City, Utah 84101

Peggy Hunt (Utah State Bar No. 6060) Michael Thomson (Utah State Bar No. 9707) John J. Wiest (Utah State Bar No. 15767) DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP 111 South Main Street, UT 84111-2176 Salt Lake City, UT 84111-2176

/s/ Melina Hernandez

Exhibit A

O CTS WKUCWTDCEJ '' EQHHKPI

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

10001 PARK RUN DRIVE LAS VEGAS. NEVADA 89145 Telephone 702-382-0711 Fax 702-382-5816

Traffic Monsoon, LLC
Attn: Charles Scoville

Invoice 330069 - 339774

June 27, 2018

ID: 14779-001 - MSE

Re: Securities & Exchange Commission

For Services Rendered Through June 27, 2018

Current Fees 167,604.50
Current Disbursements 4,257.11
Total Current Charges 171,861.61

Total Current Due 171,861.61

			Total Due		171,861.61
Total	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00

Traffic Monsoon, LLC	June 27, 2018
Re: Securities & Exchange Commission	Invoice 330069 -
I.D. 14779-001 - MSE	Page 2

		Fees		
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
03/15/17	MSE	Receive telephone call from potential co-counsel regarding	0.60	225.00
03/28/17	MSE	Review and analyze preliminary injunction order.	1.00	375.00
03/29/17	LAD	Review docket and relevant documents and prepare notice of appeal to Tenth Circuit.	0.60	96.00
03/29/17	MSE	Telephone conference with client and co-counsel regarding	2.00	750.00
03/29/17	MSE	Outline list of tasks for Tenth Circuit appeal.	1.00	375.00
03/29/17	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit court rules in preparation for drafting detailed outline of Tenth Circuit appellate process and list of tasks.	3.00	1,125.00
03/30/17	MSE	Begin reviewing key documents for use in Tenth Circuit appeal.	3.00	1,125.00
03/30/17	MSE	Review District Court docket and select all necessary documents for inclusion in appendix for Tenth Circuit appeal.	1.00	375.00
03/30/17	LAD	Begin preparation of index to appellants' appendix for Tenth Circuit appeal.	1.90	304.00
03/30/17	MSE	Revise draft of notice of appeal.	0.10	37.50
03/30/17	MSE	Revise index to appellants' appendix and compare to District Court docket.	1.00	375.00
03/30/17	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit practitioner's guide and ECF guide in preparation for drafting detailed outline of Tenth Circuit appellate process and list of tasks.	3.00	1,125.00
03/30/17	MSE	Draft detailed outline and narrative of Tenth Circuit appellate process and list of tasks to be completed.	2.00	750.00
04/03/17	MSE	Telephone conference with John Durkin to	1.60	600.00
04/05/17	LAD	Review FRAP and Tenth Circuit local rules and prepare entry of appearance and certificate of interested parties.	0.50	80.00
04/06/17	MSE	Revise Tenth Circuit notice of appearance.	0.10	37.50
04/06/17	LAD	Prepare first draft of docketing statement for Tenth Circuit appeal.	2.50	400.00
04/07/17	MSE	Formulate issues on appeal and revise draft of Tenth Circuit docketing statement.	1.00	375.00
04/10/17	MSE	Exchange emails with client on	0.30	112.50
04/11/17	MSE	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding	0.40	150.00
04/14/17	MSE	Telephone conference with co-counsel	1.00	375.00
04/14/17	MSE	Separate telephone call with co-counsel regarding	0.20	75.00

Traffic M	Ionsoo	n, LLC		ine 27, 2018 Dice 330069 Page 3
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
04/17/17	MSE	Review District Court filing of transmission of essential parts of the record to the Tenth Circuit.	0.20	75.00
04/17/17	MSE	Review docketing of Tenth Circuit appeal and exchange emails with co- counsel regarding	0.20	75.00
04/18/17	LAD	Review 28 U.S.C. 1292 and prepare motion to confirm appellate jurisdiction.	0.80	128.00
04/18/17	MSE	Review letter from Tenth Circuit clerk docketing appeal and setting deadlines for appeal filings.	0.20	75.00
04/18/17	LAD	Add FRAP 25 certification and finalize entry of appearance and certificate of interested parties; prepare email to client regarding	0.50	80.00
04/18/17	MSE	Review and revise updated version of Tenth Circuit notice of appearance.	0.10	37.50
04/18/17	MSE	Review and revise Tenth Circuit notice of no transcripts to be requested.	0.10	37.50
04/18/17	MSE	Review and revise Tenth Circuit motion to confirm appellate jurisdiction.	1.50	562.50
04/18/17	MSE	Perform legal research on rules of statutory construction dealing with a court's inability to read additional language into a statute.	1.00	375.00
04/21/17	MSE	Review SEC's notice of appearance and statement of interested parties.	0.20	75.00
04/21/17	MSE	Receive telephone call from co-counsel regarding confirmation of various tasks immediately needed for appeal.	0.40	150.00
04/24/17	MSE	Review main deadlines in the appeal and revise email to client and co- counsel confirming same.	1.00	375.00
04/24/17	LAD	Draft correspondence regarding	0.20	32.00
04/25/17	LAD	Finalize docketing statement and notice of no transcripts.	0.30	48.00
04/25/17	MSE	Exchange several emails with co-counsel	0.40	150.00
04/25/17	MSE	Exchange emails with client regarding	0.20	75.00
04/26/17	MSE	Review detailed responses from co-counsel on Reply to same	1.40	525.00
04/26/17	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit minute order requesting District Court to confirm that the record is complete.	0.10	37.50
04/26/17	MSE	Review email from SEC's appellate attorney with position on proposed motion to confirm jurisdiction. Discuss with co-counsel.	0.50	187.50
04/27/17	MSE	Review email from attorney for Chamber Reply to same.	0.20	75.00
04/27/17	MSE	Review sample Tenth Circuit briefs in previous prevailing cases in preparation for drafting opening brief.	1.40	525.00
04/27/17	MSE	Exchange additional emails with co-counsel on	0.20	75.00
04/27/17	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit mediation letter and draft email to client and co- counsel regarding	0.30	112.50
04/28/17	MSE	Make various revisions to draft of Tenth Circuit motion to confirm	1.00	375.00

Case 2:16-cv-00832-JNP Document 158-1 Filed 07/23/18 Page 5 of 18

Traffic M	/Ionsoo	n, LLC		ine 27, 2018 pice 330069 Page 4
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
	•	jurisdiction to		
04/28/17	MSE	Review websites for potential sources for Tenth Circuit proceedings. Draft emails requesting	2.00	750.00
05/01/17	LAD	Make final technical revisions to motion to confirm appellate jurisdiction; finalize motion with exhibits.	0.70	112.00
05/01/17	MSE	Make final edits to draft of Tenth Circuit motion to confirm jurisdiction.	0.20	75.00
05/01/17	LAD	Prepare correspondence	0.70	112.00
05/02/17	MSE	Review and revise correspondence	0.80	300.00
05/02/17	LAD	Finalize correspondence	0.10	16.00
05/02/17	LAD	Begin preparation of appellants' appendix; review of each selected document and begin making required omissions and redactions according to FRAP 30(a) and Circuit Rules 30(D).	3.40	544.00
05/03/17	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit order denying without prejudice motion to confirm jurisdiction.	0.20	75.00
05/04/17	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit rules on jurisdictional motions and draft detailed email to client on	1.00	375.00
05/04/17	MSE	Receive telephone call from John Durkin to discuss	0.50	187.50
05/04/17	MSE	Review Durkin's detailed response to client on	0.50	187.50
05/04/17	LAD	Continue preparation of appellants' appendix; continue review of each selected document and continue making required omissions and redactions according to FRAP 30(a) and Circuit Rules 30(D).	4.20	672.00
05/06/17	MSE	Review from client regarding	0.20	75.00
05/08/17	LAD	Continue preparation of appellants' appendix; finish review of each selected document and finish making required omissions and redactions according to FRAP 30(a) and Circuit Rules 30(D).	1.60	256.00
05/08/17	MSE	Exchange emails with co-counsel on	0.20	75.00
05/12/17	MSE	Meeting with client in Salt Lake City to discuss	5.00	1,875.00
05/15/17	MSE	Confer with staff on	0.20	75.00
05/18/17	MSE	Begin reviewing documents in current appendix to omit memoranda and potentially unnecessary pages of transcripts.	1.50	562.50
05/23/17	MSE	Review emails from co-counsel on Receive message from Tenth Circuit clerk on lack of confirmation by District Court that record is complete. Draft status email to co-counsel	1.00	375.00

Traffic N	/Ionsoo	on, LLC		ne 27, 2018 Dice 330069 Page 5
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
		with		
05/24/17	MSE	Telephone call with co-counsel to discuss	1.00	375.00
05/25/17	MSE	Review minute order and letter from Tenth Circuit clerk directed to District Court clerk to confirm that the record is complete. Draft email to client regarding	0.40	150.00
05/26/17	MSE	Begin reviewing District Court record in its entirety for purposes of narrowing Tenth Circuit appendix.	1.80	675.00
05/29/17	MSE	Review District Court letter confirming that the record is complete and Tenth Circuit notice with deadline for opening brief and appendix. Draft email to client regarding	0.40	150.00
05/31/17	MSE	Receive voice messages from client regarding Review relevant information and draft email to client regarding	0.50	187.50
05/31/17	MSE	Review new United States Supreme Court opinion discussing	1.50	562.50
06/01/17	MSE	Continue reviewing District Court record in its entirety for purposes of narrowing Tenth Circuit appendix.	4.70	1,762.50
06/05/17	MSE	Exchange emails with client regarding	0.50	187.50
06/09/17	MSE	Review email from client with Reply to same.	0.40	150.00
06/09/17	MSE	Exchange additional emails with client on	0.30	112.50
06/12/17	MSE	Review new United States Supreme Court case law on	1.00	375.00
06/12/17	LAD	Legal research of FRAP 27 regarding requirements for a motion for extension of time; prepare motion for extension of time to file the opening brief.	1.40	224.00
06/12/17	MSE	Exchange emails with client and co-counsel on	0.30	112.50
06/12/17	MSE	Revise and finalization of Tenth Circuit motion for extension of time to file opening brief and appendix.	0.20	75.00
06/13/17	MSE	Exchange emails with opposing attorney for the SEC regarding extensions of time for Tenth Circuit briefing.	0.20	75.00
06/16/17	MSE	Review clerk's order approving extension of time to file opening brief and appendix.	0.10	37.50
07/05/17	MSE	Review new opinion discussing	1.00	375.00
07/10/17	MSE	Begin reviewing additional documents in District Court record to determine which filings should be omitted from Tenth Circuit appendix based upon appellate rules.	5.00	1,875.00
07/11/17	MSE	Emails and telephone call with John Durkin regarding	1.00	375.00

Traffic N	Monsoo	n, LLC		ne 27, 2018 pice 330069 Page 6
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amoun
07/11/17	MSE	Continue reviewing additional documents in District Court record to determine which filings should be omitted from Tenth Circuit appendix based upon appellate rules.	4.00	1,500.00
07/11/17	MSE	Review case law sent by co-counsel on	1.50	562.50
07/12/17	MSE	Finish reviewing additional documents in District Court record to determine which filings should be omitted from Tenth Circuit appendix based upon appellate rules.	6.00	2,250.00
07/12/17	MSE	Review prior version of index to appellants' appendix for the Tenth Circuit and select various documents to be omitted based upon appellate rules.	2.00	750.00
07/13/17	LAD	Continue preparation of appellants' appendix; prepare documents for volumes 1-3 with bates numbering; revise index to include numbering for each document.	4.20	672.0
07/14/17	MSE	Review missing docket entries 49 and 50. Omit same from index to appellants' appendix.	0.30	112.5
07/14/17	LAD	Continue preparation of appellants' appendix; prepare documents for volumes 4-6 with bates numbering; revise index to include numbering for each document.	4.10	656.0
07/14/17	MSE	Review and respond to emails from co-counsel and receiver regarding potential stipulation to dismiss Traffic Monsoon.	0.20	75.0
07/17/17	LAD	Continue preparation of appellants' appendix; prepare documents for volumes 7-9 with bates numbering; revise index to include numbering for each document.	5.60	896.0
07/18/17	LAD	Continue preparation of appellants' appendix; convert documents to searchable text and add bookmarks to volumes 1-4 pursuant to Tenth Circuit CM/ECF rules.	3.60	576.0
07/19/17	LAD	Prepare second motion for extension of time to file opening brief and appendix.	0.30	48.0
07/19/17	LAD	Continue preparation of appellants' appendix; convert documents to searchable text and add bookmarks to volumes 5-9 pursuant to Tenth Circuit CM/ECF rules.	4.10	656.0
07/20/17	MSE	Review and revise cover pages for nine Tenth Circuit appendix volumes.	0.80	300.0
07/20/17	MSE	Review and revise second motion for extension of time to file opening brief and appendix.	0.50	187.5
07/20/17	MSE	Review and revise updated (with page numbers) index to appellants' appendix for Tenth Circuit appeal.	1.20	450.0
07/21/17	MSE	Prepare for and telephone conference with opposing attorney for the receiver and co-counsel to discuss issues regarding inclusion of Traffic Monsoon in Tenth Circuit appeal.	0.50	187.5
07/22/17	MSE	Lengthy telephone call with Charles Scoville to provide	2.00	750.0

Case 2:16-cv-00832-JNP Document 158-1 Filed 07/23/18 Page 8 of 18

Traffic M	Ionsoo	n, LLC	June 27, 2018 Invoice 330069 Page 7	
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amoun
07/26/17	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit order approving in part second extension of time to file opening brief and appendix.	0.10	37.50
08/07/17	MSE	Review District Court pleadings for	3.00	1,125.0
08/07/17	MSE	Begin identifying key authorities in District Court pleadings to review for argument.	3.50	1,312.5
08/08/17	MSE	Finish identifying key authorities in District Court pleadings and compile list of cases to read.	2.80	1,050.0
08/09/17	MSE	Review holdings in key cases to structure issues on appeal for Tenth Circuit opening brief.	5.00	1,875.0
08/10/17	MSE	Draft detailed outline of Tenth Circuit opening brief.	2.00	750.0
08/10/17	MSE	Review relevant statutes and relevant portions of the record and draft jurisdictional statement for Tenth Circuit opening brief.	2.50	937.5
08/11/17	MSE	Refine stated issues on appeal in Tenth Circuit brief.	0.80	300.0
08/11/17	MSE	Begin reviewing hearing transcript from day 1 of evidentiary hearing and take notes on important points, including review of exhibits mentioned.	4.50	1,687.5
08/14/17	MSE	Draft rough version of lengthy statement of the case/summary of argument section for Tenth Circuit opening brief.	6.50	2,437.5
08/14/17	MSE	Add record citations into statement of the case/summary of argument section for Tenth Circuit opening brief.	1.50	562.5
08/15/17	MSE	Review main cases for argument points and add to statement of the case/summary of argument section for Tenth Circuit opening brief.	3.00	1,125.0
08/18/17	MSE	Finish reviewing hearing transcript from day 1 of evidentiary hearing and take notes on important points, including review of exhibits mentioned.	4.00	1,500.0
08/21/17	MSE	Exchange emails with client regarding	0.30	112.5
08/22/17	LAD	Status email to client and co-counsel.	0.10	16.0
08/27/17	MSE	Telephone call with client to discuss	2.00	750.0
08/28/17	MSE	Begin reviewing hearing transcript from day 2 of evidentiary hearing and take notes on important points, including review of exhibits mentioned.	4.50	1,687.5
08/29/17	MSE	Finish reviewing hearing transcript from day 1 of evidentiary hearing and take notes on important points, including review of exhibits mentioned.	5.00	1,875.0
08/30/17	MSE	Email and telephone call with client regarding	0.50	187.5
08/30/17	MSE	Review District Court oral argument hearing transcript, including referenced exhibits and case law.	6.00	2,250.0
08/31/17	MSE	Perform factual research on traffic exchanges online to provide background in Tenth Circuit opening brief.	3.60	1,350.0

Traffic N	Ionsoo	n, LLC		ne 27, 2018 Dice 330069 Page 8
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
09/01/17	=	Prepare bound copies of appellants' appendix, volumes 1-9, for Tenth Circuit Court.	4.30	688.00
09/01/17	MSE	Draft factual and procedural background section of Tenth Circuit opening brief on background information on traffic exchanges.	2.00	750.00
09/01/17	MSE	Draft factual and procedural background section of Tenth Circuit opening brief on the SEC's complaint and ex parte orders obtained by the SEC, including review of relevant parts of the record and citations to the record.	6.20	2,325.00
09/02/17	MSE	Draft lengthy section of Tenth Circuit opening brief on evidentiary hearing and resulting orders, including review of relevant parts of the record and citations to the record.	8.00	3,000.00
09/03/17	MSE	Perform legal research on	1.50	562.50
09/03/17	MSE	Draft standards of review section for Tenth Circuit opening brief.	0.50	187.50
09/04/17	MSE	Outline detailed legal argument section headings for first legal argument on the non-existence of a security.	1.00	375.00
09/04/17	MSE	Perform legal research on	3.20	1,200.00
09/04/17	MSE	Begin drafting first legal argument on the lack of a security, including review of relevant legal authorities and relevant portions of the record.	4.50	1,687.50
09/05/17	LAD	Prepare correspondence to Tenth Circuit Court regarding bound copy of appellants' appendix.	0.10	16.00
09/05/17	LAD	Prepare third motion for extension of time to file appellants' opening brief.	0.50	80.00
09/05/17	MSE	Continue drafting first legal argument on the lack of a security, including review of relevant legal authorities and relevant portions of the record.	3.50	1,312.50
09/06/17	MSE	Finish drafting first legal argument on the lack of a security, including review of relevant legal authorities and relevant portions of the record.	3.00	1,125.00
09/06/17	MSE	Make initial revisions to first legal argument on the lack of a security, including further review of relevant legal authorities and relevant portions of the record.	1.00	375.00
09/07/17	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit order granting request for extension. Communicate same to client.	0.10	37.50
09/07/17	MSE	Review Morrison opinion	1.80	675.00
09/07/17	MSE	Outline specific legal argument sections to be used in second legal argument on Morrison for Tenth Circuit opening brief.	1.00	375.00
09/07/17	MSE	Perform legal research on	4.50	1,687.50
09/07/17	MSE	Begin drafting second legal argument on Morrison, including review of relevant legal authorities and relevant portions of the record.	3.00	1,125.00
09/08/17	MSE	Continue drafting second legal argument on Morrison, including review	5.30	1,987.50

Case 2:16-cv-00832-JNP Document 158-1 Filed 07/23/18 Page 10 of 18

Traffic N	Ionsoo	n, LLC		ne 27, 2018 pice 330069 Page 9
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
	12003	of relevant legal authorities and relevant portions of the record.	110415	
09/09/17	MSE	Continue drafting second legal argument on Morrison, including review of relevant legal authorities and relevant portions of the record.	5.80	2,175.00
09/10/17	MSE	Finish drafting second legal argument on Morrison, including review of relevant legal authorities and relevant portions of the record.	3.60	1,350.00
09/10/17	MSE	Make initial revisions to second legal argument on Morrison, including further review of relevant legal authorities and relevant portions of the record.	1.50	562.50
09/10/17	MSE	Draft detailed legal argument sections for third argument section on the non-existence of a Ponzi scheme.	1.00	375.00
09/10/17	MSE	Perform legal research on	1.80	675.00
09/10/17	MSE	Begin drafting third legal argument section on the non-existence of a Ponzi scheme, including review of relevant legal authorities and relevant portions of the record.	4.20	1,575.00
09/11/17	LAD	Prepare addendum and exhibits to opening brief.	0.70	112.00
09/11/17	MSE	Review second proposed stipulation from the receiver and forward same to co-counsel with initial impressions.	0.30	112.50
09/11/17	MSE	Finish drafting third legal argument section on the non-existence of a Ponzi scheme, including review of relevant legal authorities and relevant portions of the record.	3.50	1,312.50
09/11/17	MSE	Make initial revisions to third legal argument section on the non- existence of a Ponzi scheme, including further review of relevant legal authorities and relevant portions of the record.	1.00	375.00
09/11/17	MSE	Draft fourth legal argument section on partial release of Traffic Monsoon funds, including review of relevant legal authorities and relevant parts of the record.	2.00	750.00
09/11/17	MSE	Make initial revisions to fourth legal argument section on partial release of Traffic Monsoon funds.	0.50	187.50
09/11/17	MSE	Begin comprehensive revisions and additions to completed draft of Tenth Circuit opening brief, including confirmation of legal citations and record citations.	3.50	1,312.50
09/12/17	LAD	Make technical revisions to appellants' opening brief.	3.70	592.00
09/12/17	LAD	Mark all cited authority in appellants' opening brief and prepare table of authorities and table of contents.	3.20	512.00
09/12/17	LAD	Finalize tables, addendum, and exhibits for appellants' opening brief.	1.40	224.0
09/12/17	MSE	Finish comprehensive revisions and additions to completed draft of Tenth Circuit opening brief, including confirmation of legal citations and record citations.	4.00	1,500.00
09/12/17	MSE	Perform clean edit of Tenth Circuit opening brief to bring total word count within 13,000 word limit.	4.60	1,725.00
09/12/17	MSE	Revise and finalization of table of contents and table of authorities for Tenth Circuit opening brief.	0.90	337.50

Case 2:16-cv-00832-JNP Document 158-1 Filed 07/23/18 Page 11 of 18

Traffic M	Ionsoo	n, LLC		ne 27, 2018 Dice 330069 Page 10
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
09/13/17	LAD	Prepare bound copies of appellants' opening brief for Tenth Circuit Court.	1.70	272.00
09/13/17	LAD	Revise appellants' appendix to comply with Court's notice dated September 13, 2017.	3.70	592.00
09/14/17	MSE	Review minute order from Tenth Circuit setting deadline for the SEC's answering brief.	0.10	37.50
09/15/17	MSE	Draft email to co-counsel outlining	0.30	112.50
09/21/17	MSE	Draft separate emails to client and co-counsel regarding	0.30	112.50
09/23/17	MSE	Travel to downtown Las Vegas to meet with co-counsel to discuss	3.00	1,125.00
09/24/17	MSE	Lengthy telephone call with Charles to review	3.00	1,125.00
10/03/17	MSE	Exchange emails with client on	0.40	150.00
10/10/17	MSE	Exchange emails with client on	0.20	75.00
10/16/17	LAD	Prepare motion for extension of time to file reply brief.	0.70	112.00
10/16/17	MSE	Initial review of the SEC's Tenth Circuit answering brief. Draft email to client regarding	1.60	600.00
10/16/17	MSE	Revise motion to extend time to file Tenth Circuit reply brief.	0.20	75.00
10/17/17	MSE	Review minute order from Tenth Circuit confirming current October 30 deadline for reply brief.	0.10	37.50
10/18/17	TWS	Research ; discuss same with MSE.	3.50	875.00
10/18/17	MSE	Receive telephone call regarding client's status.	0.50	187.50
10/18/17	MSE	Review emails from the receiver and the SEC regarding consent to allow the receiver to file an amicus brief.	0.30	112.50
10/18/17	MSE	Review results of legal research on	0.30	112.50
10/19/17	MSE	Exchange emails with opposing attorney for the SEC regarding any potential objection to extension of time to file reply brief.	0.20	75.00
10/19/17	MSE	Draft email to all counsel with Traffic Monsoon's inability to take a position on the receiver amicus brief without first seeing the brief.	0.20	75.00
10/19/17	TWS	Assess, analyze and review Tenth Circuit law regarding	1.70	425.00
10/20/17	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit minute order granting motion in part to extend deadline to file reply brief.	0.10	37.50
10/23/17	MSE	Review the receiver's motion for leave to file amicus brief and discuss	0.50	187.50

Case 2:16-cv-00832-JNP Document 158-1 Filed 07/23/18 Page 12 of 18

Traffic N	Monsoo	n, LLC		ne 27, 2018 vice 330069 Page 11
 Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amoun
	•	points for opposition.		
10/23/17	TWS	Assess, analyze and review receiver's motion for leave to file amicus curiae brief.	1.00	250.00
10/23/17	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit order requiring any oppositions to receiver's motion for leave to file amicus to be filed within 7 days.	0.10	37.50
10/24/17	TWS	Continue drafting opposition to motion for leave to file amicus brief.	2.70	675.00
10/25/17	TWS	Finish drafting opposition to motion for leave to file amicus brief.	3.60	900.0
10/30/17	MSE	Review time table with Tom to complete draft of Tenth Circuit reply brief.	0.30	112.50
11/01/17	TWS	Continue to thoroughly assess, analyze and review existing case record in preparation of Tenth Circuit reply brief.	2.60	650.00
11/02/17	TWS	Continue to thoroughly assess, analyze and review case record in preparation of drafting Tenth Circuit reply brief.	3.60	900.0
11/02/17	TWS	Review reply in support of amicus brief.	0.60	150.0
11/03/17	LAD	Prepare second motion for extension of time to file reply brief.	0.60	96.0
11/03/17	TWS	Thoroughly assess, analyze and review SEC briefs and related materials in preparation of drafting in Tenth Circuit reply.	4.10	1,025.0
11/03/17	TWS	Thoroughly assess, analyze and review binding Supreme Court precedent and related caselaw in preparation of drafting in Tenth Circuit reply.	4.20	1,050.0
11/06/17	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit orders granting an extension of time to file reply brief and conditionally allowing receiver amicus brief.	0.30	112.5
11/06/17	MSE	Exchange emails with client on	0.20	75.0
11/13/17	TWS	Strategize with MSE on focus and arguments in reply brief.	0.60	150.0
11/13/17	TWS	Begin drafting section of Tenth Circuit reply brief regarding Morrison's applicability.	3.40	850.0
11/13/17	TWS	Begin drafting section of Tenth Circuit reply brief regarding relevant sections of Securities and Exchange Act of 1934 and their inapplicability to foreign transactions.	2.80	700.0
11/13/17	MSE	Evaluate strengths and weaknesses of potential arguments for Tenth Circuit reply brief. Identify certain arguments and evidence to support arguments.	0.80	300.0
11/14/17	TWS	Begin drafting section of Tenth Circuit reply brief discussing SEC's faulty application of agency deference.	2.40	600.0
11/14/17	TWS	Continue drafting section of Tenth Circuit reply brief discussing Section 10(b)'s lack of extraterritorial application.	2.10	525.0
11/15/17	TWS	Continue drafting section of Tenth Circuit reply brief regarding SEC's improper analysis of Morrison and extraterritoriality.	2.60	650.0
11/15/17	TWS	Begin drafting section of Tenth Circuit reply brief regarding Traffic Monsoon not involving securities.	2.40	600.0
11/16/17	TWS	Continue drafting Tenth Circuit reply brief section on inapplicability of	2.50	625.0

Case 2:16-cv-00832-JNP Document 158-1 Filed 07/23/18 Page 13 of 18

Traffic N	1onsoo	n, LLC		ine 27, 2018 pice 330069 Page 12
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
		Section 10b		
11/16/17	TWS	Begin drafting introduction to Tenth Circuit reply brief.	2.70	675.00
11/16/17	TWS	Continue drafting Tenth Circuit reply brief section on SEC's incorrect usage of Chevron deference to instant matter.	2.40	600.00
11/16/17	MSE	Review various emails addressing	0.40	150.00
11/17/17	TWS	Continue drafting section of Tenth Circuit reply brief regarding Section 10(b)'s lack of extraterritorial application.	2.40	600.00
11/17/17	TWS	Continue drafting section of Tenth Circuit reply brief regarding inapplicability of Chevron deference.	2.70	675.00
11/17/17	TWS	Continue drafting section of Tenth Circuit reply brief regarding conduct- and-effect test's prior case law being irrelevant for instant appeal.	2.10	525.00
11/17/17	TWS	Continue drafting section of Tenth Circuit reply brief regarding Traffic Monsoon not constituting a Ponzi.	1.90	475.00
11/18/17	TWS	Continue work on Tenth Circuit reply brief section regarding Section 10b's inapplicability	4.50	1,125.00
11/18/17	TWS	Finish initial draft of Tenth Circuit reply brief's section on why AdPacks are not securities.	4.50	1,125.00
11/18/17	TWS	Begin drafting section of Tenth Circuit reply brief regarding Traffic Monsoon failing to meet elements of Ponzi scheme.	1.10	275.00
11/19/17	TWS	Continue Tenth Circuit reply brief.	3.40	850.00
11/21/17	TWS	Finalize initial draft of Tenth Circuit reply brief.	3.80	950.00
11/22/17	MSE	Review and evaluate initial draft of Tenth Circuit reply brief.	1.50	562.50
11/24/17	MSE	Review record and compile list of additional factual issues to support factual assertions in Tenth Circuit reply brief.	3.50	1,312.50
11/24/17	MSE	Review legal authorities cited in Tenth Circuit reply brief and identify additional areas of research for next draft of reply brief.	2.80	1,050.00
11/24/17	MSE	Begin reviewing legal research on new areas of research for draft of Tenth Circuit reply brief.	3.40	1,275.00
11/27/17	TWS	Apply final edits to Tenth Circuit reply brief; discuss same with MSE	1.70	425.00
11/27/17	LAD	Make technical revisions to reply brief; mark all cited authority and prepare table of contents and table of authorities; finalize brief.	3.10	496.00
11/27/17	MSE	Finish reviewing legal research on new areas of research for draft of Tenth Circuit reply brief.	3.00	1,125.00
11/27/17	MSE	Draft additional factual information into draft of Tenth Circuit reply brief.	1.60	600.00
11/27/17	MSE	Draft additional information into Tenth Circuit reply brief regarding new legal research.	2.20	825.00
11/27/17	MSE	Make final revisions and edits to draft of Tenth Circuit	1.70	637.50
11/27/17	MSE	Revise and finalization of table of contents and table of authorities for Tenth Circuit reply brief.	0.40	150.00
11/28/17	LAD	Prepare correspondence to Clerk of the Tenth Circuit regarding copies of reply brief.	0.20	32.00

Case 2:16-cv-00832-JNP Document 158-1 Filed 07/23/18 Page 14 of 18

Traffic Monsoon, LLC		June 27, 2018 Invoice 330069 Page 13		
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
11/28/17	LAD	Prepare 7 bound paper copies of reply brief for Tenth Circuit.	1.30	208.00
11/29/17	MSE	Telephone call with client regarding	0.50	187.50
12/08/17	TWS	Assess, analyze and review notice of change of address.	0.10	25.00
12/08/17	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit oral argument schedule for 2018 and draft email to client regarding	0.20	75.00
12/11/17	MSE	Exchange emails with client on	0.20	75.00
01/11/18	TWS	Assess, analyze and review Tenth Circuit email setting argument date.	0.10	25.00
01/11/18	MSE	Review notice of oral argument setting and related documents. Exchange emails with client and co-counsel regarding	0.40	150.00
01/15/18	MSE	Telephone call with client to discuss	1.20	450.00
01/16/18	MSE	Review acknowledgement form from Shirey to argue for the SEC in the Tenth Circuit.	0.10	37.50
01/16/18	TWS	Assess, analyze and review SEC's calendar acknowledgment form.	0.10	25.00
01/17/18	TWS	Meet with MSE regarding	0.40	100.00
01/17/18	MSE	Communicate with client and co-counsel regarding	1.50	562.50
01/18/18	TWS	Research in preparation for oral argument/subsequent filings; email MSE regarding	0.40	100.00
01/22/18	TWS	Discuss moot court preparation and travel arrangements with MSE	0.60	150.00
02/09/18	LAD	Begin preparation of master table of authorities for oral argument.	1.20	192.00
02/12/18	TWS	Research Tenth Circuit case law regarding ; discuss same with MSE.	1.80	450.00
02/12/18	TWS	Draft email to Loren Washburn regarding	0.90	225.00
02/12/18	MSE	Review emails from co-counsel on Discuss with TWS	1.00	375.00
		and evaluate findings on		
02/14/18	MSE	Telephone conference with co-counsel regarding	0.60	225.00
02/20/18	LAD	Continue preparation of master table of authorities for oral argument; continue adding summary notations for each cited authority.	1.30	208.00
02/26/18	LAD	Continue preparation of master table of authorities for oral argument; finish adding summary notations for each cited authority in opening brief.	2.20	352.00
02/26/18	LAD	Continue preparation of master table of authorities for oral argument; list out all cited authority in the answering brief and begin adding summary notations for each authority.	3.50	560.00
02/28/18	LAD	Continue preparation of master table of authorities for oral argument; continue adding summary notations for each authority in answering brief.	4.60	736.00

Case 2:16-cv-00832-JNP Document 158-1 Filed 07/23/18 Page 15 of 18

Traffic M	Ionsoo	n, LLC		ne 27, 2018 Dice 330069 Page 14
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amoun
03/01/18	LAD	Continue preparation of master table of authorities for oral argument; finish adding summary notations for each authority in answering brief.	0.60	96.00
03/01/18	LAD	Continue preparation of master table of authorities for oral argument; list out all cited authority in the receiver's amicus brief and add summary notations for each authority.	0.70	112.00
03/02/18	LAD	Continue preparation of master table of authorities for oral argument; list out all cited authority in the reply brief and add summary notations for each authority.	3.20	512.00
03/05/18	LAD	Begin preparation of oral argument binder; gather and orgainze all cited case law.	4.10	656.0
03/05/18	LAD	Continue preparation of oral argument binder; gather and organize all cited regulatory law.	1.30	208.0
03/05/18	LAD	Continue preparation of oral argument binder; gather and organize all cited court rules.	0.30	48.0
03/05/18	LAD	Continue preparation of oral argument binder; gather and organize all cited statutory law.	1.40	224.0
03/06/18	LAD	Finish preparation of oral argument binder; gather and organize all other cited authorities and treatises.	0.50	80.0
03/06/18	LAD	Make technical revisions to master table of authorities and finalize for oral argument binder.	0.60	96.0
03/07/18	LAD	Prepare correspondence to co-counsel with prepare	0.20	32.0
		correspondence to client with		
03/07/18		Review master table of authorities for Tenth Circuit oral argument.	1.50	562.5
03/12/18	LAD	Prepare notice of appeal from second amended order appointing receiver.	0.40	64.0
03/12/18	MSE	Review District Court's second amended order appointing receiver and calculate time to appeal from same.	0.80	300.0
03/12/18	MSE	Revise draft of District Court's second amended order appointing receiver.	0.20	75.0
03/12/18	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit argument calendar including identity of panel. Review short biographies of panel members.	0.60	225.0
03/12/18	MSE	Meeting with Tom to discuss	0.50	187.5
03/12/18	MSE	Review key parts of the record, Tenth Circuit briefs, and key cases to prepare for meeting with co-counsel to discuss	5.50	2,062.5
03/12/18	TWS	Begin preparation for moot court in Salt Lake in preparation for next week's oral argument.	1.00	250.0
03/13/18	MSE	Travel to Salt Lake City for lengthy meeting with co-counsel to discuss	12.00	4,500.0
03/13/18	TWS	Travel to and from Salt Lake for oral argument preparation with MSE and Loren Washburn; conduct oral argument prep.	12.00	3,000.0
03/14/18	MSE	Review email from receiver and documents	0.30	112.5

Case 2:16-cv-00832-JNP Document 158-1 Filed 07/23/18 Page 16 of 18

Traffic Monsoon, LLC		June 27, 2018 Invoice 330069 Page 15		
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
03/14/18	MSE	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding	0.20	75.00
03/16/18	MSE	Review brief filed in U.S. Supreme Court discussing	1.50	562.50
03/16/18	MSE	Review new case discussing	1.50	562.50
03/16/18		2.2 2.2	0.60	225.00
03/19/18	MSE	Exchange emails with opposing attorney for the SEC regarding motion to supplement the record	0.20	75.00
03/19/18	LAD	Finalize motion to supplement the record under FRAP 10(e)(3), or alternatively, motion to take judicial notice under FRE 201(b); forward same to client with	0.90	144.00
03/20/18	TWS	Travel to Denver for Tenth Circuit argument; final argument preparation with MSE and Loren Washburn.	7.00	1,750.00
03/20/18	MSE	Travel to Denver for Tenth Circuit oral argument and meet with co- counsel to discuss	7.00	2,625.00
03/21/18	TWS	Attend Tenth Circuit oral argument; debrief; travel home from Denver.	10.00	2,500.00
03/21/18	MSE	Attend Tenth Circuit oral argument, discuss , and travel back to office in Las Vegas.	10.00	3,750.00
03/22/18	TWS	Assess, analyze and review order regarding oral argument.	0.10	25.00
03/26/18	LAD	Prepare docketing statement for appeal in Case No. 18-4038.	0.70	112.00
03/27/18	LAD	Prepare entry of appearance and certificate of interested parties for new appeal.	0.20	32.00
03/28/18	MSE	Draft docketing statement for new Tenth Circuit appeal.	1.00	375.00
03/28/18	LAD	Finalize entry of appearance and certificate of interested parties for second appeal.	0.10	16.00
03/28/18	LAD	Finalize docketing statement for second appeal.	0.40	64.00
03/28/18	MSE	Review other recent authorities for	1.00	375.00
03/28/18	MSE	Perform legal research on	1.50	562.50
03/28/18	MSE	Perform legal research on	2.00	750.00
04/02/18	MSE	Outline and draft Tenth Circuit motion to consolidate appeals or stay.	2.00	750.00
04/03/18	LAD	Make technical revisions to motion to consolidate appeal with Case No. 17-4059, or alternatively, motion to stay appeal pending resolution of Case No. 17-4059; finalize same.	0.40	64.00
04/03/18	MSE	Exchange emails with opposing attorney for the SEC regarding its position on consolidation or stay. Revise errata to motion regarding same.	0.60	225.00
04/03/18	LAD	Prepare errata to motion to consolidate appeal with Case No. 17-4059,	0.40	64.00

Case 2:16-cv-00832-JNP Document 158-1 Filed 07/23/18 Page 17 of 18

Traffic M	Ionsoo	n, LLC		June 27, 2013 voice 330069
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Page 10 Amoun
Date	Atty	or alternatively, motion for stay of appeal Pending resolution of appeal in Case No. 17-4059.	Hours	7 x moun
04/05/18	TWS	Assess, analyze and review receiver's notice of non-participation.	0.10	25.0
04/05/18	TWS	Assess, analyze and review SEC's response to motion to stay and consolidate.	0.20	50.0
04/05/18	MSE	Review the SEC's response to Traffic Monsoon's motion to consolidate appeals or stay.	0.30	112.5
04/05/18	MSE	Review the receiver's notice of non-participation in the second Tenth Circuit appeal.	0.10	37.5
04/06/18	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit order staying second appeal.	0.10	37.5
04/12/18	TWS	Assess, analyze and review motion to withdraw and order related thereto.	0.20	50.0
04/20/18	MSE	Draft detailed email with	0.60	225.0
05/02/18	MSE	Telephone call to discuss	0.60	225.0
06/05/18	LAD	Prepare status report to Tenth Circuit regarding continued abatement of case pending resolution of Case No. 17-4059.	0.40	64.0
06/05/18	MSE	Revise Tenth Circuit status report and coordinate approval with co- counsel.	0.20	75.0
06/05/18	TWS	Assess, analyze and review status report filed with Tenth Circuit.	0.20	50.0
06/06/18	MSE	Review Tenth Circuit order setting schedule for status reports in second appeal.	0.10	37.5
06/20/18	MSE	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding	0.40	150.0
06/21/18	MSE	Review documents in file and Tenth Circuit briefing regarding Draft email to co-counsel regarding	1.30	487.5
06/22/18	MSE	Review new opinion from U.S. Supreme Court regarding Draft email to co-	0.80	300.0
		counsel regarding		
06/22/18	TWS	Assess, analyze and review recent US Supreme Court case	0.40	100.0
		Total Fees 540.	50	167,604.50
		Disbursements		
Date		escription		Amoun
		cer; Online Records Review		21.3
		estlaw Research		1,123.7
09/12/17		neck Issued; Overnight delivery; Federal Express		63.5
10/13/17	Cl	neck Issued; Overnight delivery; Federal Express		64.4

Case 2:16-cv-00832-JNP Document 158-1 Filed 07/23/18 Page 18 of 18

Traffic Mo	nsoon, LLC	June 27, 2018
		Invoice 330069 Page 17
Date	Description	Amount
12/19/17	Check Issued; Overnight delivery; Federal Express	36.35
01/31/18	Travel Expenses; R - Airfare to/from Denver for oral argument - Micah Echols and Tom Stewart	499.92
01/31/18	Travel Expenses; R - Airfare to/from Salt Lake City for oral argument preparation meeting - Micah Echols and Tom Stewart	259.92
	Copies	1,324.75
	Postage	2.78
	Long Distance Expense	10.85
	Scanning Charges	195.75
03/31/18	Travel Expenses; R - Parking while attending oral argument practice	16.00
03/31/18	Travel Expenses; R - Uber fee to co-counsel's office for oral argument preparation meeting	20.15
03/31/18	Travel Expenses; R - Uber fee from co-counsel's office after oral argument preparation meeting	26.83
03/31/18	Travel Expenses; R - Parking fee while attending oral argument preparation meeting in Utah	23.00
03/31/18	Travel Expenses; R - Uber fee to oral argument in Colorado	56.00
03/31/18	Travel Expenses; R - Hotel fee while attending oral argument in Colorado	491.58
03/31/18	Travel Expenses; R - Uber to oral argument preparation meeting in Utah	20.15
	Total Disbursements	4,257.11

Exhibit B

Micah S. Echols, Esq.

MARQUIS AURBACH COFFING 10001 Park Run Drive Las Vegas, Nevada 89145 Phone: (702) 207-6087 Fax: (702) 856-8956 mechols@maclaw.com

EXPERIENCE:

MARQUIS AURBACH COFFING Director, July 2012-present Of Counsel, July 2010-June 2012 Associate, December 2003-June 2010

Mr. Echols focuses his practice on civil appeals, including state and federal appeals, writ petitions, and petitions for judicial review of agency decisions. Since joining Marquis Aurbach Coffing, Mr. Echols has participated in the briefing or argument for more than 200 appellate matters. He has argued cases in both the Nevada Supreme Court and the Ninth Circuit. Clients and other attorneys often consult Mr. Echols for his knowledge of appellate procedure and preserving issues in the District Court for appeal. His appellate successes include reversals of jury verdicts, reversals of non-jury trials, obtaining extraordinary writ relief, and obtaining appellate decisions upholding favorable rulings for his clients. Mr. Echols holds an AV Preeminent rating from Martindale-Hubbell and has been recognized by Super Lawyers for his appellate practice.

Mr. Echols has published approximately 40 articles on appellate topics and recent developments in the law. His publications include the Civil Appeal Checklist with Forms, which is a comprehensive checklist for processing an appeal to the Nevada Supreme Court. The most recent version of the checklist incorporates the amendments that the Supreme Court has made to the Nevada Rules of Appellate Procedure. He has also authored chapters for the updated Nevada Appellate Practice Manual published by the State Bar of Nevada. Mr. Echols also frequently publishes legal articles that have appeared in Nevada Lawyer, a publication of the State Bar of Nevada; Communiqué, a publication of the Clark County Bar Association; Advocate, a publication of the Nevada Justice Association; CCIM Perspective, a publication of the Southern Nevada Chapter of Certified Commercial Investment Members; and the Las Vegas Business Press.

Aside from his proficiency in appellate courts, Mr. Echols also regularly handles matters in trial courts. In fact, Desert Companion recognized him in 2014 as a top lawyer for appeals, and VEGAS INC recognized him in 2012 as a top lawyer in Southern Nevada for lawsuits/disputes. Additionally, Mr. Echols earned the designation "NITA Advocate" in 2009 from the National Institute for Trial Advocacy for trial, deposition, and communication skills.

PUBLISHED OPINIONS:

Ninth Circuit Opinions

- Jones v. Las Vegas Metro. Police Dep't, 873 F.3d 1123 (9th Cir. 2017) (clarifying standing principles under FRCP 17 for claims asserted by a decedent's estate in 42 U.S.C. § 1983 civil rights cases).
- Tsao v. Desert Palace, Inc., 698 F.3d 1128 (9th Cir. 2012) (affirming summary judgment for police officer from civil rights claims by advantage gambler).

Nevada Supreme Court Opinions

- *Mendenhall v. Tassinari*, 133 Nev. Adv. Op. No. 78, 403 P.3d 364 (2017) (explaining that an accepted offer of judgment can serve as the basis for claim preclusion in a subsequent lawsuit involving the same parties or their privies).
- Schwartz v. Lopez, 132 Nev. Adv. Op. No. 73, 382 P.3d 886 (2016) (amicus curiae for Foundation for Excellence in Education) (confirming the constitutionality of the Education Savings Account ("ESA") program under Nevada Constitution Article 11, Sections 2, 6, and 10, but enjoining the use of public education funds absent a separate appropriation for the ESA).
- *Mona v. Dist. Ct.*, 132 Nev. Adv. Op. No. 72, 380 P.3d 836 (2016) (clarifying that a co-trustee of a judgment debtor trust cannot be compelled to provide evidence regarding personal finances).
- Fergason v. Las Vegas Metro. Police Dep't, 131 Nev. Adv. Op. No. 94, 364 P.3d 592 (2015) (explaining how courts should treat the NRS 179.1173(5) civil forfeiture conclusive presumption in summary judgment proceedings).
- City of N. Las Vegas v. 5th & Centennial, LLC, 130 Nev. Adv. Op. No. 66, 331 P.3d 896 (2014), cert. denied, 135 S.Ct. 718 (2014) (clarifying that prejudgment interest on a landowner's claim for precondemnation damages commences with the first date of compensable injury).
- *Gunderson v. D.R. Horton, Inc.*, 130 Nev. Adv. Op. No. 9, 319 P.3d 606 (2014) (affirming a favorable verdict in a 38-day construction defect jury trial and construing offer of judgment principles with NRS 40.655 on the limitation of attorney fees).
- ReconTrust Co., N.A. v. Zhang, 130 Nev. Adv. Op. No. 1, 317 P.3d 814 (2014) (explaining that the law of the case doctrine does not apply to respondents on appeal that do not assert alternative grounds for upholding the appealed judgment).

Nevada Supreme Court Opinions (continued)

- Las Vegas Metro. Police Dep't v. Yeghiazarian, 129 Nev. Adv. Op. No. 81, 312 P.3d 503 (2013) (excluding blood alcohol content of personal injury plaintiff due to absence of corroborating evidence and clarifying attorney fees awards for non-attorneys).
- Stilwell v. City of North Las Vegas, 129 Nev. Adv. Op. No. 76, 311 P.3d 1177 (2013) (clarifying that there is no right to appeal to the Supreme Court based upon NRS 176.115 when the case originates in an inferior tribunal such as a municipal court).
- Bisch v. Las Vegas Metro. Police Dep't, 129 Nev. Adv. Op. No. 36, 302 P.3d 1108 (2013) (upholding discipline based on off-duty conduct of police officer as constitutional).
- Dynamic Transit v. Trans Pac. Ventures, 128 Nev. 755, 291 P.3d 114 (2012), cert. denied, 134 S.Ct. 682 (2013) (construing Carmack Amendment preemption and creating exception for conversion claim).
- Clark County v. S. Nevada Health Dist., 128 Nev. 651, 289 P.3d 212 (2012) (interpreting NRS 439.365 to prohibit the County from interfering with submitted budgets).
- Club Vista Fin. Servs., L.L.C. v. Dist Ct., 128 Nev. 224, 276 P.3d 246 (2012) (prohibiting depositions of opposing counsel unless very narrow exceptions are met).
- Wheble v. Dist. Ct., 128 Nev. 119, 272 P.3d 134 (2012) (refusing to extend to NRS 11.500 savings statute to excuse affidavit requirement of NRS 41A.071).
- *Berkson v. LePome*, 126 Nev. 492, 245 P.3d 560 (2010) (striking NRS 11.340 as unconstitutional for violating separate of powers doctrine).
- Sanchez v. Wal-Mart Stores, Inc., 125 Nev. 818, 221 P.3d 1276 (2009) (determining that pharmacies do not owe a duty of care to unidentified third parties who are injured by pharmacy patients).
- In re Estate and Living Trust of Miller, 125 Nev. 550, 216 P.3d 239 (2009) (holding that an offer of judgment includes attorney fees incurred on appeal).
- *Countrywide Home Loans, Inc. v. Thitchener*, 124 Nev. 725, 192 P.3d 243 (2008) (clarifying the standard to recover punitive damages under NRS Chapter 42).
- *D.R. Horton, Inc. v. Dist. Ct.*, 123 Nev. 468, 168 P.3d 731 (2007) (establishing the reasonable threshold test for construction defect notices under NRS 40.645).

PUBLICATIONS/PRESENTATIONS:

Legal Articles

- Five Things to Remember in Ninth Circuit Appellate Practice, COMMUNIQUÉ 28 (Jan. 2017).
- Drafting Attorney Fees Order to Withstand an Appeal to the Nevada Supreme Court, 21 Nev. Lawyer 6 (Aug. 2013).
- Navigating Post-Judgment Motions in Nevada State Court, 20 Nev. LAWYER 6 (Jan. 2012).
- What Is the Proper Measure of Damages Owed for Wrongful Deprivation of Real Property?, 35 NJA ADVOCATE 23 (Nov./Dec. 2011).
- Using Motions in Limine at Trial to Effectively Preserve Appeal Issues, 32 COMMUNIQUÉ 23 (Oct. 2011).
- Remember to Demonstrate Good Cause When Attempting to Serve the Summons and Complaint, 35 NJA ADVOCATE 19 (Sept./Oct. 2011).
- Punitive Damages Can Lay Businesses Low; Learn How They Happen, LAS VEGAS BUSINESS PRESS (Dec. 27, 2010).
- Can Savings Statutes Cure the Failure to Attach a Medical Malpractice Affidavit to a Complaint?, 31 COMMUNIQUÉ 16 (Nov. 2010).
- Don't Let Procedural Issues Spoil Your Supreme Court Appeal, 34 NJA ADVOCATE 11 (Nov./Dec. 2010).
- Co-Author, Offers of Judgment in Nevada: Best Friend or Worst Enemy?, 18 Nev. Lawyer 33 (Nov. 2010).
- Seeking Emergency Relief in the Supreme Court of Nevada, 34 NJA ADVOCATE 13 (Sept./Oct. 2010).
- Taking Advantage of Property Tax Appeals, CCIM Perspective 4 (Jul./Aug. 2010).
- Co-Author, Comprehensive Changes to the Nevada Rules of Appellate Procedure, 18 Nev. Lawyer 26 (June 2010).
- When Can a Supreme Court Appeal Be Decided on the Record?, 34 NJA ADVOCATE 11 (May/June 2010) (reprinted in 32 THE WRIT 12 (May 2010)).
- When Is Final and Binding Arbitration Not Final and Binding?, CCIM PERSPECTIVE 4 (Jan./Feb. 2010).

Legal Articles (continued)

- When Should You Use an Amicus Curiae in Your Nevada Supreme Court Case?, 31 THE WRIT 14 (Dec. 2009).
- Remember to Include Effective Interest Provisions in Your Real Estate Contracts, CCIM Perspective 4 (Sept./Oct. 2009).
- Who Has Standing to Make a Construction Defect Claim?, 30 COMMUNIQUÉ 20 (Oct. 2009).
- Overcoming Jurisdictional Defects in Your Civil Appeal to the Supreme Court of Nevada, 33 NJA ADVOCATE 14 (Sept./Oct. 2009).
- Co-Author, The Nevada Supreme Court Comprehensively Amends the Nevada Rules of Appellate Procedure, 17 Nev. Lawyer 30 (Jul. 2009).
- To What Extent Can the Offer of Judgment Penalty Provisions Under NRS 17.115 and NRCP 68 Be Applied?, 30 COMMUNIQUÉ 16 (June/Jul. 2009).
- Common Pitfalls to Avoid when Filing a Civil Writ Petition to the Supreme Court of Nevada, 33 NJA ADVOCATE 13 (May/June 2009).
- Co-Author, *Justice Done:* Countrywide Home Loans, Inc. v. Thitchener, 32 NJA ADVOCATE 9 (Nov./Dec. 2008).
- Expediting Litigation and Appeals in Real Estate Cases, CCIM PERSPECTIVE 4 (Jul./Aug. 2008).
- Preparing Your District Court Case for an Appeal to the Supreme Court of Nevada, 16 Nev. Lawyer 14 (2008).
- When Should You Consult an Appellate Attorney?, CCIM PERSPECTIVE 5 (Jan./Feb. 2008).
- When Are Attorney Fees Incurred on Appeal Recoverable?, 29 COMMUNIQUÉ 28 (Mar. 2008).
- "Litigation-Avoidance" Provisions Do Not Necessarily Void Appeal Rights, 28 COMMUNIQUÉ 36 (Dec. 2007).
- When Should You File a Cross-Appeal After the Opposing Party Has Appealed to the Supreme Court of Nevada?, 31 NTLA ADVOCATE 11 (Nov./Dec. 2007).
- Common Pitfalls to Avoid in Civil Cases when Filing a Notice of Appeal to the Supreme Court of Nevada, 31 NTLA ADVOCATE 14 (May/June 2007).
- Seller Beware: Pitfalls to Avoid When Selling Real Property, 3 REAL ESTATE SUCCESS MAGAZINE 16 (2006).

Legal Articles (continued)

- The Supreme Court of Nevada Amends NRAP 16 GOVERNING SETTLEMENT CONFERENCES IN CIVIL APPEALS, 14 Nev. Lawyer 16 (2006).
- Co-Author, Contaminated Property? Relief and Reason May Be Within Sight, Focus, A Supplement to The Enterprise, September 16, 2002, at 9.

Law Review Articles

- Is the Courtroom the Right Place for Religion? Difficulties in Restricting Religious Arguments During the Sentencing Phase of Pennsylvania Death Penalty Cases: Commonwealth v. Spotz, 36 UWLA L. REV. 254 (2005).
- Changing the Face of Premises Liability in Nevada: Davenport v. Comstock Hills-Reno Requiring an Affirmative Duty for Premises Owners to "Maintain" and Upgrade, 37 UWLA L. Rev. 76 (2004).
- Are Private Automobile Insurance Companies Replacing Workers' Compensation Coverage When the Employee/Insured is Injured in the Course and Scope of Employment by a Third-Party Tortfeasor?: Rubin v. State Farm Mutual Automobile Insurance Company, 2 PIERCE L. REV. 17 (2004).
- Striking a Balance Between Employer Business Interests and Employee Privacy: Using Respondeat Superior to Justify the Monitoring of Web-Based, Personal Electronic Mail Accounts of Employees in the Workplace, 7 Comp. L. Rev. & Tech. J. 273 (2003) (citing references: Marc A. Sherman, Webmail at Work: The Case for Protection Against Employer Monitoring, 23 Touro L. Rev. 650 (2007); Delfino v. Agilent Tech., Inc., 145 Cal. App. 4th 790, 52 Cal. Rptr. 3d 376 (2006); Meir S. Hornung, Think Before You Type: A Look at Email Privacy in the Workplace, 11 FORDHAM J. CORP. & FIN. L. 115 (2005); Kevin W. Chapman, I Spy Something Read! Employer Monitoring of Personal Employee Webmail Accounts, 5 N.C. J. L. & Tech 121 (2003)).

Books

- Chapters on Civil Jurisdiction and Attorney Fees, Costs, and Sanctions, NEVADA APPELLATE PRACTICE MANUAL (2d ed. 2016).
- CIVIL APPEAL CHECKLIST WITH FORMS (NJA 2d ed. 2008 & 3d ed. 2009).

Presentations

- Post-Judgment Motions in State and Federal Courts, 2017 Nevada Government Civil Attorneys Conference (May 11, 2017).
- The Future of Your Case: Appellate Issues to Remember During Trial, NJA LITIGATOR LUNCH (Mar. 9, 2016).

Presentations (continued)

- Co-Presenter, Construction Defect Claims: Offers of Judgment, Trial Strategies, and Appellate Strategies, Nevada State Bar Construction Defect Seminar (Dec. 3, 2014).
- Moderator, Appellate Ethics and Preserving Issues for Appeal in the Nevada State District Courts, Nevada State Bar Annual Meeting (Jul. 12, 2014).
- Offers of Judgment in Nevada State Court: NRS 17.115 & NRCP 68, CCBA CLE SEMINAR (Feb. 7, 2013).
- Civil Appeals and the 2008 Amendments to the Nevada Rules of Appellate Procedure, NJA LITIGATOR LUNCH (Mar. 11, 2009).
- Co-Presenter, *Punitive Damages and the Impact of the* Countrywide Home Loans v. Thitchener *Decision*, NJA LITIGATOR LUNCH (Nov. 6, 2008).

EDUCATION:

J. REUBEN CLARK LAW SCHOOL, BRIGHAM YOUNG UNIVERSITY Juris Doctor, August 2000-April 2003

- Member, BYU Law Review 2002–2003
- Partial BYU Law School Merit Scholarship 2000–2003

BRIGHAM YOUNG UNIVERSITY

Bachelor of Arts, August 1994-December 1999

- Major: Spanish with emphasis in linguistics and grammar
- Partial BYU Merit Scholarship 1997–1999

BAR ADMISSIONS:

- Nevada, 2003
- United States District Court for the District of Nevada, 2003
- United States Court of Appeals for the Ninth Circuit, 2007
- United States Supreme Court, 2007
- United States Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit, 2013
- United States Court of Appeals for the Tenth Circuit, 2016